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in the goat semen freezing. In conclusion, 
the extenders supplemented with 40 μg/ml 
PC in the goat semen freezing could reduce 
sperm oxidative damage, decrease 
apoptotic level and improve sperm quality. 
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The perennial root crop yacon 
[Smallanthus sonchifolius (Poepp. and 
Endl.) Robinson], native to the Andean 
mountain region, is a tuberous crop mainly 
grown for its edible underground organs 
rich in inulin-type fructooligosaccharides 
of low caloric value. Due to habitat 
destruction, land degradation, and 
environmental changes, there has been a 
rapid erosion of its genetic diversity. Such 
condition, along with the risk of pest and 
diseases, creates the need to use advanced 
biotechnological approaches as an 
alternative to preserving the species' 
genetic material and its biodiversity. This 
study aims at using the Plant Vitrification 
Solution No.2 (PVS2) droplet vitrification 

method to develop an efficient 
cryopreservation protocol for the long-term 
preservation of yacon. To carry out the 
experiment, apical shoot tips (2-3 mm long) 
were excised from 3-4 weeks old in vitro 
cultures of four yacon cultivars (one 
allooctoploid (2n=8x=58) from Ecuador, 
two allooctoploids from Bolivia, and two 
dodecaploids (2n=12x=87) from Peru). 
After pre-treatment (0.3M SUC+12hrs 
dark), these were placed in loading solution 
(20 min at 22°C). Three different time 
intervals for PVS2 dehydration at 0°C were 
tested (15, 30, and 60 min). Thereafter, 
shoot tips were exposed to ultra-rapid 
cooling in liquid nitrogen (1 hr) and then 
placed in an unloading solution for thawing 
(22 °C for 15 min). Next, post-cryo cultures 
were placed on recovery (MS or MS+1 
mg/l BA). Post-thaw survival, regrowth, 
and quality of shoot tips were evaluated. 
The results showed that PVS2 is an 
efficient method for the cryopreservation of 
all tested cultivars of yacon with MS 
without 0.1 mg/l BA as regrowth media, 
and PVS2 60 min treatment duration is the 
most effective in providing the highest 
survival (87-90%) and regrowth (62-75%) 
rates, respectively, with no morphological 
abnormalities, post cryopreservation. The 
BOL23 genotype showed the highest shoot 
tip regrowth percentage (75%) post 
cryopreservation, followed by ECU41 
(73%), PER12 (73%), PER14 (70%), and 
BOL22 (62%). 
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Search the new approaches to the treatment 
of peptic ulcer disease is an urgent problem 
of modern medicine. One of the potential 
antiulcer agents is cryopreserved placenta 
extract. The study was conducted on 28 
male rats weighing 200–220 grams. After 
24 hours of fasting, rats were administered 
intragastrically with prednisolone (20 
mg/kg) dissolved in 80.0% ethyl alcohol 
(0.6 ml/100 grams of animal body weight). 
Cryopreserved placenta extract was 
administered intramuscularly at a dose of 
0.16 ml/kg body weight in the prophylactic 
mode – once a day for 5 days before the 
introduction of alcohol-prednisolone 
mixture. 24 hours after administration of 
the alcohol-prednisolone mixture, rats were 
removed from the experiment and 
macroscopically assessed the condition of 
the gastric mucosa according to the 
following criteria: bloating, edema, 
redness, hemorrhage and folding disorders. 
For each group, the percentage of 
experimental animals was calculated 
according to the specified characteristics 
and the average value of their expression, 
which was evaluated on a scale: 0–3 points. 
The study showed that in 100.0% of control 
rats (model pathology without treatment) 
marked (3 [3; 3] points) hyperemia of the 
gastric mucosa (p<0,05). In addition, the 
presence of hemorrhage, edema and 
folding disorders caused by the 

introduction of alcohol-prednisolone 
mixture was noted. Prophylactic five-day 
administration of cryopreserved placenta 
extract before the introduction of 
ulcerogenic mixture led to a statistically 
significant (p<0.05) decrease in the 
severity of damage to the gastric mucosa in 
rats. Thus, hyperemia, hemorrhage and 
mild edema of the gastric mucosa were 
observed in only 28.6% of rats. The 
obtained data indicate the ability of 
cryopreserved placenta extract in the 
prophylactic mode of administration to 
increase the endurance of the gastric 
mucosa to the action of alcohol-
prednisolone mixture. 
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